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SIEM
Designed for network-wide threat
monitoring and forensic analysis.

XDR
Delivers a holistic view of security
across all IT layers.

MDR
Enhances threat detection and
response with Managed Detection
and Response.

SOC
Optimized for full operational visibility
and efficient incident management.
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Vulnerability Management

Vulnerability management provides a
comprehensive security approach,
including regular reports and expert
guidance to develop a prioritized
action plan for addressing
vulnerabilities.

Human Risk Management

Human Risk Management focuses on
reducing risks linked to human factors
within your organization. It offers a
premium service with seamless
implementation, on-demand training,
role-specific programs tailored to
different positions, and real-time
feedback.
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vCISO

A vCISO provides the strategic
direction and leadership of a Chief
Information Security Officer in a virtual
and more accessible format. This
service is essential for businesses
needing expert guidance without the
resources for a full-time executive
position.

InfoSec Advisor

Focusing on future-proofing your
information security policies, InfoSec
Advisory services ensure your strategy is
customized to address current
challenges while remaining flexible to
adapt to future needs.
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GET IN TOUCH
WITH US!
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